
Vendor Name

HUB Status

Item 

No. ITEMS Qty Unit  Unit Price  TOTAL PRICE  Unit Price  TOTAL PRICE  Unit Price  TOTAL PRICE 

Dexis Software:
1 Dexis Software License Ver 9 or 10: Mfg.: 

DEXIS; Mfg #: PLU817 

1 EA 1,995.000$  1,995.00$        -$            -$              -$            -$             

2 DEXnet Software Module (Multiuser 

License for Unlimited Computers): Mfg.: 

DEXIS; Mfg. #: PLU222 

1 EA 795.000$      795.00$           -$            -$                  -$            -$             

3 DEXIS Integrator for use with EagleSoft, 

Easy Dental, Practiceworks, Softdent, 

Dentistoft Office and others: Mfg.: DEXIS; 

Mfg. #: PLU227 

1 EA 795.0000$    795.00$           -$            -$              -$            -$             

4 DEXimage Software Module (For Intraoral 

Cameras, Digital Cameras, and Micro): 

Mfg.: DEXIS; Mfg. #: PLU202

Stock #104-6439

1 EA 1,195.000$  1,195.00$        -$            -$              -$            -$             

Dexis Sensor: 
5 Additional DEXIS Platinum Digital X-Ray 

System and 24 months of BASICcare 

Service: Mfg. #: 135-5284

3 EA 8,795.000$  26,385.00$      -$            -$              -$            -$             

Dell Laptop:
6 Dell Inspiron Laptop matched for DEXIS 

to include: Operating System - Windows 7; 

Screen - 15.6 HD (720p)WLED with 

Truelife (1366x768); Processor - Intel Core 

i3-3227U; Memory - 4GB; Storage - 500 

GB 5.4K RPM; Optical Drive - Internal 

DVD±RW; Graphics - Intel HD Graphics 

4000; Audio - Waves MaxxAudio 4; 

Wireless - Dell Wireless-N 1705; Webcan; 

Bluetooth; Keyboard with Multi-touch 

Touchpad; Battery 64-cell; 3 Year 

Hardware Limited Warranty.

3 EA 620.00$        1,860.00$        -$            -$             

Dexus Training:
7 Dexus Training - 4 hours EA -$               -$                 -$            -$             

Freight/Delivery:
8 Transportation/Freight/Delivery/ 1 EA 150.00$        150.00$           -$            -$             

TOTAL 33,175.0000$  

AWARDED TO: Henry Schein
AWARD DATE: 11/13/2013

AWARD AMOUNT: $33,175.00

Awarded by:

P.O. # 4003703

TBR 3

Non HUB: 0

M/AS

F/WO 2

M/HI

HUB SENT: 3

HUB RES: 2

Bids Sent 4

No Bid No Bid

Elise Wells

BID TABULATION

IFB:  10/30/13

IFB/PO # 4003703

AMI Dental Lab

F/WO

No Bid 

All Star Xray

F/WO

No Bid


